
CITY 0F ST. GEORGE

Bv couNCIL MEMBER I.[ECK:

ORDINANCE NO. 202J-015

AN  ORDINANCE  To  ENACT  TITLE  8  oF  THr+:  C`oDE  oF
ORDINANCES     RELATIVE     TO     BUILDINGS     AND     TO
PROVIDE FOR RELATED MATTERS

WIIEREAS  the  Cit:}7  of  St.  George  desires  to  adopt  the  most  recent  edition  of  the
lnternational Building Code. International Residential Code. Intei.national Existing Building Code,
Inteniational  Mechanical  Code.  Louisiana  State  Plumbing  Code.  International  Code  Council
Cocles. and the National Electrical Code. as of the date of zidoption b}J' the Louisiana State Uniform
Co]istruction  C`ode  Council.  as  amended;  to  enact  ordinances  tQ  provide  procedures  for  the
administration of building c{tdes; to enact ordinances to provide foi. permit requirement for house
moving  in  St.  George;  to  enact  ordinances  to  provide  for  the  i`onstruction  and  installation  of
pipelines in public rights-of-way or over and across an}r public or private property within; and to
enact ordinance adopting fee schedule related to these ordinances identical to the City of Central
current fee schedule.

BE IT ORDAINED by the St. George City Council. State of Louisiana Title 8 Buildings,
Chapters  1. 2. 3, 5 and 6 are enacted as follows:

Section 1. Enactment

Title 8. BUILDINGS
CHAPTER I. BUILDING CODE

PART I.  GENERAL PROVISIONS

See.  8:1.  Adoption  of the  latest  edition  of the  lnternati{}nal  Building  Code,  International
Resid€ntia] Code, and International Existing Building Code

{a)         The  regulations  of the  most  recent  edition  of the  International  Biiilding  code  {"IBC"),
International  Residential  Code  (."IRC"`}.  Intemational  E.listing  B`iilding  Code  {"]EBC"i
and the International Propert}.. Maintenance Code {JPMC`). as {if the date of adoption by the
Loiiisiana   State   Uniform   Construction   Code   Council   {"LSU{`CC"'.}   as   amended   and
published by the lnt€.rnational Code Council. Inc..  published  in book  form and the whole
thereof.  and  such  portions  of the  building  code  as  are  hei.einafter  deleted.  modified  or
amended.  are  hereb}r:  adopted  as  the  regiilations  governing  the  construction  of buildings
and othei-structures in St. Geiirge.

( "        Et{;I::c: `::.::;, ;-:,:`esree;]ac]:ail.i I:dt:1;L:; :::: a[f`ts:;esc':fail: ::i.:`j:}]]tss! ::`];e:I €`:]}]]d}£::.::i ::: }c]:1:,I:i:i` :h}:c:£i.I :€ji:t=

onhr tliose portions of the stand€]rd shall b€ enforced.  Wfhihre code pro\'isions conflict withI

Page  I  of 37



a standard. the code provisions shall bc enfoi.L`ed. Permissive and advisory provisions in a
standard shall not be construed as mandator`i..rl

(c)         Except  as  hereinafter  provided,  it  shflll  be  lmlawful  to  construct,  enlarge,  alter,  repair,
move, demolish, or change the ol`cllpanc}r' of any building ol. stl-ucture, ol. to erect, install,
enlarge,   alter,  r€paii..   remove.   conveil  or  replaL`e  any   electrical,   gas.   mechanical   or

plumbing system. the installation of`uJ-hich is rcgillatL`d by the technical codes, or to cause
any such wo&.k to be done. without rirst making application to the building official to obtain
the required permit l`or the work.

(d)         The building official  shall  accept Gel.titled third-pal.ty providers en¥ag€d in plan reviews
on behalf of commercial and residential contractors. Third party providers shall be £€rtified
and  in  good  standing  with  the  Louisiana  State  Uniform  Construction  Code  Council
established by  La.  R.S.  40:1730.23.  Prior to any  submittal,  the third-party provider shall
submit evidence that it is certified in accordanL`e with La. R.S. 40: 1730.23 to the building
official.  The  hui]ding  o±`ficial  shall  maintain  listing  of qualified  providers.  The  building
official I.eserves the right to siispgnd or removi` any third-party' provider forjust cause. The
building official  shall  establish  a listing of all  elements oj` a plan  i.eview that third-party

providers  may  submit  and  certif}r  -for  a  coiltractor or homeowner.  The  building  official
reserves  the  right  to  approve  all  third-party  plan  review.s  for  compliance  with  sewer
capacity, draining, traffic. UDC re`'iew. code oversight and floocl zone determination. The
building official  w.ithin eight business da.vs of submission  shall  issue an approval  of the
building permit or a report outlining any deficiencies in siich submitted application.

(e}         In  connection  with  the  construction  of any  building,  structure  or other improvement  to
immovable  propert}/'.  neither  the  performance  of  any  enforcement  proL`edure  nor  any
provision of a building code shall constitilte or be construed as a warrant}' or guarantee by
the building official or thii.cl-part}. pro\r'ider as a durabilit}r or fitness, that said building or
structure  or other  improvement  to  immovable  propel.t}.r  or ally.  materials.  equipment:  or
methocl or type of construction used thei-Sin is or will be free from defects. will perform in
a particiilar manner. is fit for a particulai. purpose or \`ill last in any particular way.

See. 8:2. Work exempt from permits.

Building permits shall not bi. required 1`or the follo\\t+ing work:
(1)    Painting;
(2}    Floor coverings such as carpet or vin}/.I tile:
(3)   Replacing shingles and/or I.i-p]ai`ing not more than  100 square 1`ee[ of roof decking;
(4)   Repair/replace sheet rock or paneling in not more than one `\.all provided the-wall is not a

rated assembly or part of the means of L]gI.ess:
(5)    Repaii./replace sot`fit/rascia board:
(6`)   Fence repair not to exce€cl a total i]f 25  liliear feet:
{7)   Fences that are w.oven wii.e  less than  ft}ur feet high.  and fences not more than 30% solid

alid less than thi.ee i`e€t high:

{8)    Woocl decks not moi.e than 30 inc`hes abo`'e grade. with no roof. and nttt over 400 square
feet in floor area:

Pflge 2 of 37



(9}   Gardeulcourtyard arbors that are accessory``' to a resideni`e;
{ I 0} Pot-table accessory storage structures not exceeding 120 square feet in floor area:
( 1 I } Replacing residential drive\\fra}'s provided there are no alterations or modirications with the

location and/or profile of the existing dri`t-ewa}';
(12} Structures used exclusiv€l}'  for agricultural purposes {sheds.  stables.  poiiltr}'  hoLises) that

meet all thiJ following pro\'isions:
a.    Not available forpublic use;
b.    Located not less than loo feet from the property line and or from any habitable structure

such as a dwi-lling or commercial building:
c.    Not iiior€ than one story and not o\;.-er 15 feet in height:
d.   Not more than I .500 square feet in floor area;
e.    Locatec[ on not less than ten acres of land intended for agricultural use:
f.    One side of the structure {25% of the perimeter) is permanently open to the exteiior:
9.    No plumbing and/or mechanical equipment shall b€ installed:
h.    No structural member shall exceed an  18-foot unsupported span:
i.     Sti.uc`tures located within a flood plane area are designed using tloodprooling methods.

as requii.ed  by FEMA  (Federal  Emergency  Management Agenc}f'.}.  so as tti minimize
the danlage caused b}r. flood waters:

j.     Structui.es are clesigned and constructed to comply with the minimum design loads as
required by this Code:

k.    Not located in any public ser\f'itude. Casement and/or right-of-way.
( 13)  Minor non-structural repairs nan-safety related;
(14)   Installation of vinyl or aluminum siding;
( 15)  Move or add non-bearing walls that do not interfere or alter means of egress:
( 16)   One-stor}'r detai`hed accessor}'' structures are exempt from permitting. provided the flool-

area does not exceed 200 square feet and the structure is not cormected to utilities:

Note: A pemiit shall be required if work exceeds the above minimums. or if the biiilcling official
determines om? is required.

See. 8:3. Designation of offlcial.

1±` an}J  provision  o1` this  title  shall  refer to  a  municipal  of`ficer  or  city  employee  whose

position is vacant at the time action is required b}`. the officer or employee. then the provision shall
be construed to appl}J to an}7 .such person that the Mayor shall designate in place of sui`h ol`iicer or
emp]O}-ee.

PART 11. INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE {"IBC"), INTERNATIONAL
RESIDENTIAL CODE {"IRC"} AND INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE

("IEBC")

See.  8:2{}.   App]ic€tb]€  Ch:`pters   of  Intern:)tional   Building  Code  {"IBC"},   Interniitiona]
Residential C{}de ("IRC"} an(I International Existing Building Code {"IEBC"}

Thi`  I-et|ukitions o±` the most rec`ent edition  of the  following chapters  of the  lnternational
Building   Cttdt`   ("IBC".).   International   Residential   Code   ("IRC"')   ancl   International   Existing

Page 3 of 37



Building Code ("IEBC"} as of the date ot` adoption by the  Louisiana Sta{€ LJniforiu Construction
Code Council  as amended. and published by  the  lnte].national  I,`ocie  CounL`il.  published  in book
form  and  the  whole  thereof,  and  such  ptJrtions of   the  IBC`.  IRC`.  and  IEBC  as  fire  hereinafter
deleted, modified or amended, arLL hereby adopted as the i.ggulations governing the construction of
buildings, residences, and other structures in the city. Not less th{in t\ly.o i:opjes of such code shall
be kept on file in the city services office foi. re+'iew and inspection b}r the ptiblic.

{ I ) International Building Code ("IBC")
a.      Chapters  1  through  10.
b.      Chapters  12 through26.
c.      Chapter28.
d.     Chapters 30through 35.
e.     AppendicesB,C.D,Fandl.

(2) Intemational Residential Code.
a.      Chapters  1  through  ll.
b.      Chapter24.
c.      Chapter43.
d.      AppendixJ.

(3} lntemational Existing Building Code.
Chapters  1  through  15

See.  8:21.  Amendments  to  Amendments  to  lnt€rnationa]  Building  Code,  Int€rnationa]
Residential Code, and International Existing Building Code

Amendments   to   the   International   Building   Code.   Internati(inal   Residciitial   Code.   and
International Existing Building Code adopted b}.r section 8: 1. are amendecl as 1`{tllows:

1.    Section  101  (IBC} (IEBC`} and (IRC) ai.e amended  lo reacl as folli>h'-s:
a.    Section  101.1  Title. These regulations shall be kno\r\`n as thi-Building Code. of the City-

of St. George. hereinafter referred to as "this Code."
2.    Section  101.2 (IBC) Scope. The exc`eptions are hercb},' amt?nded as follo\\J.s:

Exception #2 is hereby added to read as following: To\\J'nh{just3s are dL`IiliL`cl as two or more
attached  living  units  with  common  or party  sidew`alls  bet\\'egn  imits.  d€signatgd  so  that
each unit may be sold independentl}i`- as a lot `+`ith its own }rards and pal.king spaces.

3.    Section  ]01.4  R€ferenced  Codes  {IBC}.102.4  {IEBC)  and  {`IRC`}  are  hereby  amended  to~

read as follows:

The following Codes shall  be adopted  as  if spet`ifii`all}.  rel`erenL`ed  in  this C`ode ancl shall
be considered pall oi` the I.equirements of this C`od€s to the pi.esc`ribecl  cxti.nt of each such
reference:

(a}  Secti()n  101.4. I {IBC).102.4. I  {IEBC') ancl  103.+. I {IRC) Electrical. -I`he most recent
NFPA 70 National  Electrical Code as amendi`cl tind all r€ferenci`s herein.

(b)  Section    101.4.2{IBC}.   ]02.4.2   {]EBC")   €lnll    llr}3.4.={IRC)   G€ls.   The   in()st   recent
lmemational Fuel Gas Code and all rcTerenccs her.Sin.

Page 4 o}`37



{c)  Section   lol.4.3(IBC).1()3.i.3   (IEBC}  and   102.4.3{IRC)  Mechanical.  The  most
recent Intemationa] Mechanical Code as amended and all references herein.

(d)  Section  101 I.4(IBC`.).  I t)2.4.+ {IEBC} and  102.4.4{IRC) Plumbing. The most recent
Louisiana State Plumbing Codi. and all references herL`in.

4.    Section R106.I .2 {IRC} is aml]nded to add the fo]lohTing:
Section R106. I .2 -Manufacturers and Fabricators.

Where  the  permit  issuecl  is  f`or  a  Ill(Jdular  biiildi]lg.  a  i`ertificate  from  an  inspection
agenc}f. hii.ed b}. the o\\'ner or manufacturer and approved by the building official, may
be  accepted  in  lieu  ot` I.equired  }oc`al  inspections.  The  certificate  shall  state  that  the
builcling  has  bee-n  in.spectecl  b}'  the  approved  agency  and  is  in  compliance  with  the
ln{ei.national    Resideiitial   C`ode.   tlie   National   Electrical    Code.   the   lntei.national
Mechanical   Code  ancl   the   L£\   State   Plumbing  Code  as  amended   and   has  been
constructed in accordance with plans and specifications.

5.    Section  106  (IBC)  {lEBC)  aiid  ('IRC)  is hL|.eb+'  added  to  read  as  stated  in  section  8:210~

(construction documents).
6.    Section 105. I .3 {`IBC`) alid Sectitin  105.1.1  {IRC) is hereby added to read as stated in section

8:240 {temporai.}J'  utilitii.st.
7.    Section R105.7 (IRC`} is flmendeci to read €[s stated in section 8:233 {Inspection card).
8.    Section 106.3.4.3 IBC is added to read as stated in section 8:37 {Certificate ofcompletion}.
9.    Section 113.4 (IBC} and Section R113.+ {IRC) is cimended to read as stated in section 8:252

(Vitilation penalties).
10.  Section R104.7 {IRC} Records is amended to read as stated in  section 8:253 {Records).
11. Section R106.3.4 {a} -Transfer of ci\\.nership is amended to read as stated in section 8:251.
12. Section   108   (IBC)   and   Section   R}08   (IRC.}.   Fees   are   ameiidecl  to  read   as   follows:

Commercial ancl residential constriietion. The schedule of permit fees set forth in Appendix
A of this Title 8 shall app|}r..

13. IBC  Appendi.t{  "8"  Boat.d  ot` Appeals.  Section  8101.2  {IBC}  and  Section  R112  {IRC}
deletecl am] amended to read as stated in Title I. Chapter 5. See. 511 {a} of this Code Section
Blot.4  (IBC`)  and  Section  I 12  {IRC`}  deleted  ancl  amended  to  read  as  stated  in  Title  1,
Chaptei. 5. See.511 (b} to See.5 I I (g,I) aml Title 8. Chapter 3 of this Code of Ordinances.

PART Ill. INTER7`TATIOJTVAL MECHANICAL CODE

See. 8:30. Adoption {}f International Mechiinical Code.

The regtilations of the nitist i-i.i`ent i`dition of the lnternational Mechanical Code {"IMC"),
including Appendix  A.  as of the date {if cidoption  b}i'  the  Louisiana  State  Uniform  Construction
Code Couiicil  as  amendecl.  ancl  published  b}.  t}1e  International  Cocle Council.  published  in book
foi.in and the \\J+hole- thereof. and such pot.tions of the mechanical code as are hereinafter deleted.
modified  or  amended.  are  hereb`r  adopted  as  the  regiilations  governing  the  installation  and~

servicing  of ail.  conditioliing.  heating.  `,.entilation  anci  mechanical  refrigeration  systems  in  the
construction of buildings and other structures  in the cit}'.  Not less than two copies of such code
shall be kept on file in the cit};. ser\ici`s office for rc\ ii-w and inspection by the public.

P:i{Ie  5  of` 3 7-



See. 8:31. Amendments to lntei-national Mechflmii`fll Code

Amendments   to   lntcmational   Mechanical   Code   ("IMC"I).   adopted   by   sei`ti{m   8:10,   are
amended as follo\\t.s:

(a)  Appendix 8 of the International Mechanical Code. Schedule of pemlit Fees. is hereby deleted.
(b)  Cliapter 1  of tJie lnt€rnati{)na] iMee`haiiical Code. Administi.ation, is hereby amended and added

{o this  part  to  I.Cad  as  s{atgd  in  section  8:300 (Duties and authority  of Constl.uction  Board  of
Appeals,.

(c)  See.  109.8. ("C} is hei.i-b}i. acldecl to I.Cad as stated in section 8:32(+iL`ense I.eqLiirecl,).
{d)   Sect.106.I-]06.2  {IMC',}  Permits  is  hereb}r  deleted  and  amended  to  read  as  state{l  in  s€L`tion

8:34.

(e)  See.   106.3.I   (`IiMC)   is   hereby   deleted   and   amended  to   read   as   stated   in   section   8:210
(Construction dociiments.).

{1)   See.107.1  (IMC,)  required  is  hereb}J-deleted  and  amended  to  read  as  stated  in  section  8:234
(Inspection ser\j'ii`es}.

See. 8:32. License and certirlcation require{].

It shall  b€ Linla\,\-fLil  for any person to engage in business as an ail. conditioning and heating
contractor as defin€d hil-gin without first hat+'ing obtained a state mechanical work  license and a
certification  by  the  Environmental  Protection  Agency  (EPA}  to  purchase  sgrvici-  and  install
equipment uJith refrigerant. Any person who desires to do air conditioning, heating. ventilating or
mei`hanical   refrigeration   work   upon   his   own   residencet   which   he   occupies.   must   hold   a
certification by the  EPA  to  purchase.  service and  install  equipment with refrigerant per Sei`tion
608 a.f US EPA. Title +0 subpal.t F part 82 to obtain a homeowner mechanical permit. Provided
that he files the appliL`atio]i. obtains the permit required and performs all such work in accordance
with the pro\'isions orthis Code.

See. 8:33. Mi]nufacturing and Testing MeL`hanical Equipment.

The   Construction   Boal-d   of  Appeal   is   authorized   to   establish   safet}J'   requii.t:ments   for

protection  o1` the  public  in  connection  with  the  manufacturing  or  testing  oi` air  coiiditioning.
heating. refrigei.ation or i+'enti]ating materials. devices. appliances or apparatiis.

Scc. 8:3J. Permits required.

(]}    A   peiiiiit.   w.hic`h   shall   be   in   addition   to  the   btlilding  permit,  shall   be  obtained   for  ail.
conditioniiig.  h€atilig.  \,''entilation  and  mechanical  refrigeration  work.  bell)re  an\`-  \\.t)rk  is

rT

started. The o\\`'ner must reside at the property for a homeowner's residential permit.
{2)    No permit shall bLa I-equirecl for repairs to existing s.vstems: ho\`'e\J.Ll.. all suc`h repail. \\J+oi-k shall

be pet.formccl in accorclanL`e with the provisii}ns t}f this Title.
(3)    A  permit  shall  bL`  obtained  for  alterations.  additiL)ns  oi.  change  out  of a  majt]i.  component

(L`onc]ensing  imit.  c{it>ling  coils.  air handling  unit  or heating  unit} or an  origi]ial  installation.
Alt€rati()ns allll t]ulditions shall  include an}tr  c`hange  in in\'olving all €xti.11sio]l to the sir.sll`m. a

rT

Pagt. 6 o f 3 7



change in the arrangement. type or purpose of the original installation. a change in size or any
relocatioii.

(4}   All  applications shall be made on forms supplied by the permit office and shall  contain all
information requested thereon.

(5)   A permit shall not be issued to anyone other than persons desigliated by the owner or owners
of a firm.

(6}   A permit issued shall be construed to be onl}J' a license to proceed with the work and shall not
be interpreted as authority to violate. cancel. alter or set aside any  of the provisions of this
Code,  nor  shall  such  issuance  of a  permit  pre\'ent  the  building  o£`ficial  from  thereafter
I.equiring a correc`tion of errors in plans or construction  or of `'iolations of this Code.  Any

permit issued shall become inv.alid if \\,.ark is terminated for a period of one year.

PART IV. PLUMBING CODE

S€c. 8:40. Adoption o1. state plumbing code.

There  is  hereby  adopted  the  regulations  of the  most  recent  edition  of the  Louisiana  State
Plumbing Code3  as  of the date  of adoption  by  the  Louisiana  State  Unit`orm  C`onstruction Code
Council as amended. and published in book form and the \;\f.hole thereof. are hereby adopted as the
regulations governilig the construction ol` buildings and other structures in the city. Not less than
two copies of such code shall be kept on file in the L`it}' ser\;.ices office for inspection.

See. 8:41. Applicability.

The provisions of this Code shall appl}J to e\J.ery'' plumbing installation. including alterations,
repairs.   replacement,   equipment.  appliances.   fixtures.   rittings  aiid  appurtenances.  and  when
ctlnnected to a i.\rater or sewerage system.

See. 8:42. Amendments.

Amendments  to  Louisiana  State  Plumbing  Code,  adopted  b}'  section  8:40.  are  amended  as
follows:

{a}    Section  1004.4.I  is hereb}' added to read as follo\+-s:
Section  1004.4.1  -Grease Traps/Grease Interceptors  for Multi-Family  Housing in the City
of St.  George.  A grease trap,''grease  interceptor appi.oved  b}r the plumbing o£`ficial  shall  be

providecl for all multi-t`clmil}f housing in the Cit}r' of St. George with iiiore than two dwelling
units. and for all buildings containing t\\t'o or more rLlital dwellings.

(b)    See.  8: I (.}1.3.1.  is amended to reftd as stated in section 8:41(Applicability)
{c,)    See.  8: 103.  is amended to read as stated in Chapter 2. Part 2. (Permits)
{d}    See. 8:103.2.I. is hereby added to read as stated  in seL`tion 8:310(C`onstruction documents)

Pagi- 7 or` 3 7



See. 8:43. Master p]umbers'  res|}onsibi]it}:.

(a)    Plumbing  work.  inL`luding  installation.  replacement  and  repail.  of pipes.  fixtures  or  other
apparatus, for supplying gas or water and removal of liquid oi. waterborne waste. in buildings
and on private premises. is the exclusi\t'e I-esponsibility of the master plumbers.

(b)   Application for a plumbing permit shall be filed with the Depailment of public Works b}f. the
licensed master plumber or his authorized representative before beginning the ciinstruction.
reconstruction.  alterations.  repail.s  (except  as  hereafter  provided)  of  any  portion  of  the
plumbing syst;in of any building. Suc`h application shall state clearly the location of the work
to be done, the type and  number ot` fixtures to be  installed oi. altered,  location and point t]f
discharge of the property sewer. No permit shall be required for repairing of leaks, unstopping
of pipes or replacing broken traps. pipes or fixtures: how.ever, a permit shall be required  for
installation or replacement of all hot u''ater heaters. Any person may clean out building sewers
and/or building drains by I.odcli]ig or b}+' any other approved mechanical device or mechanism.

provided such cleaning is done through a threaded cleanout by removing the screw plug or by
cleaning through the soil or waste stack opening above the roof.

See. 8:44. Gas fitters li€ens£.

All  contractors  who  install,  1.epair.  replace.  or test gas  lines  must  possess  a  current  gas
fitters license issuecl by the Pal.iLf+h {if` East Baton Roi]ge.

See. 8:45. Waste water tlischarge.

All   industrial   and  commercial   users  of  the  sanitary   sewer  must  apply  for  a  sewer
pretreatment application.

PART V. NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE

See. 8:50. Adoption of lnternati{}nal Code Coiincil Codes and National Electrical Code.

The regulations of tile ]iit)st recent edition of the lnternational Code Council  {"ICC") Codes
and  the  National  Electrical  Code.  as  of the  date  of adoption  b}r  the  Louisiana  State  Uniform
Construction Code Council as amended. and published in book form and the whole thereof. and
such poilions of the electrical  cttde as are  hereinafter deleted.  modified or amended.  are hereby

~

adopted  as  the  regii]ations  governing  the  performance  of electrical  work  and  the  operation  ol`
electrical work and  the coiiduct of business b}' those engaged in such work including exaniining
and  licensing  therefore.  Not  less  than  two  copies  of such  L`ode  shall  be  kept  on  file  in  the  cit\.

rl

services officL-for review and inspi`ction b}j. the piiblic.

See. 8:51. Placing of wires.

Jt shall  be the dut}f' of the building inspector to regulate aml d€ternrine the placing ot`wii.es
or other applianL`es for L.Iectric light. ht`at. ol. pot+ter in all buildings in the cit}rr and to cause all such

PagL. 8 ol` -i 7



wires  or  appliances  to  b€  placed.  constructed  ancl  guarded  as  not  to  i`ause  fires  or  accidents
eiidangei.ing ]i fe oi-propert}''.

See. 8:52. Notice on removal of w'iring.

Whenever  builders.  or  persons  engaged  in  repairing,  painting.  etc..  f`incl  it  necgssar}ry  to
remove  wires  from  buildiiigs  in  prosecuting  theii.  work,  the  o\,\iiei.  of  such  building  oi.  thi`
contractor  eiigageci  therec)n  shall  serve  the  inspector  with  written  notice  24  hours  before  such
contemplatecl work  is begun and the inspector shall  hat.'e authority  in his discretion to clireet the
o\,\t`ncr {}1` such wires to riliiove the saiiie.

S€c. 8:53. Permit for a]tc]rations.

No alterations shall be made in the \tviring of any building for light, heat or power. or increase
in the load carl.ied  b}r  such wires. nor shall any building bc wired for electrical  lights. motors. or
heatiiig devices without a written permit.

See. 8:54. Old `t'ires to be remo`'ed.

Electric contractors wiring old buildings or structures for electric light heat or power where
elei`tric or gas lighting systems have been used are required to remove all old superfluous wires.
pipes. fixtures. ancl related equipnient. before wiring the building or structure.

See. 8:55. Inst€ilkttion ol. other items.

It shall  bi-unlaw+ful  for an}' plumber, gas or steam fitter or other person. to install.  fix or

pl¢lce ally. metal  pipe  in a building liearcr than three inches from an electric  light or power wire.
unless such  light oi. p{iwer wire is iiisulated under such requirements as may  be  imposed by  the
electrical iiispector. No fixture or othe}-construction shall be designed or constructed so as to block
access to electrical  s\+J`itches o]-other electrical installations. free and unrestrii`ted access lo \`'hich
is required in order to provide adequate and safe service to the premises.

See. 8:56. Work to be done under direction of electrical inspector.

Whenever wires.  now or hei.eafter erected.  are moved  under permission  of section  8:52.
such \j\t''ork shall bc done under the direi`tion of the electrical inspectoi-and b}' competent electrician
clt the expense of thi- p€rsc}n procuring the change.

Sec`. 8:57. Public buildings.

In  €ill  builclings w.hei.e the  genei.al  piiblic  has access.  the corridors.  stai"f.€i}i.s.  lobbies and
exits must be suflici€ntlv lightecl to allo\`f-a safe and read}' egress fi-om such buildings at sui:h time*

as the general public has access to sanie. No person shan install ur-iring of a temporar}r i)r decorative
charactei. in. or about an}f. buildiiig or structure \,\'ithout first ha`jing obtained permission in u.ritilig
from the electrie€il  insp€ctGr to install  such work. and the inspector is authorized to grant \\.ritten
and  limitecl appro\.al  for ail}'. temporali`. installation \\.hich may in his opinii)n be necessfii.}r.

I]age 9 ot-37



PART VI. RESIDENTIAL CONTRACTOR'S CODE

See. 8:60 Definitions.

The following definitions shall apply in the in{€i.pt.i-tatiiln a)ic[ €nf{ti.c€m€nt of this i`hapter:

Person.  Whenever  the  word  "person"  is  11.sed  in  this  C`ode.  "pers{]n"  shall  include  an}7
inclividual. partnership` corporation or firm ()r other enti{\'.

~

Residential  contractor  shall  mean  an}7  pi-1.son.  rii.in  o1.  corporatio]i  whi)  as  the  primary
contractor is  required to  obtain  a bliilding  permit  1`runi  the  Depa]-tnicnt ol` Public  Works
and  who  engages  in  the   building,  constructio]i.   iilstflllation.   I.emod€ling  or  repair  of
residential  structures,  including duplexes.  tiiplexes or fourplexes.  where the cost of said
work (including labor} exceeds the sum of $ 1.5{)0.

See. 8:61. License required by residential contractors.

(a)         Any  person,  firm  or  corporation  who  as  the  primal-}t  contractnl.  is  I.eqiiired  to  obtain  a
building permit from the Department of Pub]jc  Works ancl  who engages  in the building,
consti.uc{ion,   installation.   rebuilding.   remodg]ing   or   repaii.   of  residential   structures.
including duplexes, triplexes or fourplexes.  must  bi-  1it`€nsed  b}J the state  licensing board
for contractors.

(b)         This provision shall not app]}r to minor repail-,.`i-ehabilitatioi"".k \J.alued at less than sl ,500
including labor. Nor shall this provision apply. to thL` fol]ou'-ing: To indjvidua]s performing
construction, rebuilding, remodeling or repair of {lieir perso]ial I.esidence provided that they
do not apply for more than one building permit per projec`t duiing a  12-month period and

provided they sign a statement iipon application l`{ir a buildi]ig pi'rmit relieving the City of
St. George from any liability in connection there\\,ith a]id  f`iii.ther asserting that they have
received and read the Louisiana Ne\\-Home Warrailt}r' Act. La. R.S. 9:3 ]4]  and are aware
of  all  attendant  liabilities  and  responsibilities  imposed  b}.   La.   R.S.   9:3141.  The  term
"project"  shall  mean  the  construction  o1` a  ni`\\'  ri-siclential  sti.iictur€.  including.  biit  not

limitecl to. duplexes, triplexes and fourple.`es.  The  term  "pri)jL`ct"  shall  not be interpreted
to mean renovation or remodeling of the same I.esidenci] at dit`ferent times. This provision
shall apply only to a situation in \vhich a building permit is 1.t`quir€d under this title.

See. 8:62. Effective date of compliance.

No permit to per£`orm an~v coiistruction \,`ithin  the sL`ope of this chapter shall  be  issued to
an}J. person. firm or entity not holding a state I.esideiitial  i`i)ntr€lclor.s  liL`unse.

PART VII. FLOOD HAZARD.

S€c. 8:70. Requirements in event of flood hazard.

(a)  Before a building permit is issued. the floodplain admiiijsti-ator s]iall iii`ti`iiiiinL. whether or ni]t
the proposed building site is 1.easonabl}J'  safe from  flooding: aml if a  llood hazard exists. shall
notify  the  permit  applicant  that  an.\'  pl.oposLtd  ne\\-constriii`tion  or  subst{.intial  impro\,'em€nt

Page  10 ot` 37



should:

{1)  Be  design€cl  (or  modified)  ancl  anchored   to  prevent  flotationt  collapse.  or  lateral
movement o±` the structure:

(2}  Use construction materials ancl iitilit}+ equipment that are resistant to flood damage; and
(3}  Use construction methods cincl pi.actices that will minimize flood damage.

{b}  Elevation requirements  foi. builciing pet-mits. No building permit for any newt construction or
substantial   improvements   of  existing   coiistruction   shall   be   issued   until   the   applicant's

professional engineer. Iancl sur\.e}-i)r or €il.c`hitect certifies: on the basis of the latest base flood
elevation  data  a\tJailable.  All  nL"  construi`tion  and  substantial  improvements  of residential
sti.uctures  ha`'e  the  lou.est  floor {inclucling  basement)  elevated  to,  flood  proofed  to  or at  or
above thi.  I-`o]lovIJ.ing requirenieiits:

(1}         Forall substantial impi.o\.emcnts. the minimum lowest floorelevation shall meet or
exceed one foot abu\'c the FIRi\f'I base lloiid elevation.
(2}           Foi.  all  ne\\.t'  I.esidential.  nonresidential.  and  manufactured  homes,  the  minimum
lowest floor elevation shclll meet or I-xceed each of the following levels: one foot above the
FIRM base flood ele\'.atio]i. i)ne foot abo\.e the center line of the street, and one foot above
the top of the lou`-el. iipstrcam or do\\.nstream sanitary sewer manholes between the house
connection. The minimum slab i-lL]`'£ition shall be one foot above the center line of the street
shall not apply \\`.hell the appro\.ed drainage schematic contemplates that:

(i)   The street pavement \\,ill liot ser\'e as the drainage collector system; or
(ii} Drailiage will not be con\.cyed ti}u.ard the street.

(c)  The basis for establishing the areas ol` special flood hazard shall be the areas of special flood
hazard identifiecl b\t. the Fedei.al Emergenc}. Management Agency in the most recent scientific
and  engineering  repiirt  entitled.  "Tlie  Flood  Insurance  Study  for East  Baton  Rouge  Parish.
Baton Rouge & Vicinit},`." \\titli accompan}'ing flood insurance rate maps and flood boundary-
floodwa}/' maps and tln}' rc\'isio]is thereto.

(d) Elevation requirements  for cci.tif]catc {tt` occupancy. A certificate of occupancy  for any new
construction or substantial  impro\'ement of existing construction shall not be issued until the
applicant's pn]fessional engineer.  land  sur\€}.or or architect has certified, on the basis of the
latest base flood ele`-ation data a\-ailable that the ne\\-' construction or substantial improvement
of the existing constrLictiiin mccts or c`.`ceeds the requirements of section See. 8:40{b}(2).

(.e-)  Drainage  schematic  I.iTqiiirl`cl.  Unless  other\\`ise  appi.oved  b}t.  the  engineering  manager,  an
application  for  a  building   pcl-mit  shall   inL`lucle  a  drainage  sL`hematic  ol`  the  building  site
conforming   to   tli€   c{}nsulting   engineer's   clppro\'ed   dl.ainage   layout   for   the   subdivision.
Elevation  sliall  ilot  be  raised  b\r  the  ciddition  of fill  unless  pursuailt  to  a  ciistui.bance  permitrl

pursuant to Section

See. 8:71. Establishment of disturbitnL`c permits.

(a)   A distlirbance pLl.mit shall  he reqiiii-ecl prior to:

Page  11  of 37



{1-)         Any disturbance by means of mechanized equipment;
(2)         Tree ronoval by means of mechanized equipment:
{3)         The  delivery  to  or removal  from the  location  ofsoil.  sand.  tree materials.  or fill

mflt€rial  in excess of 12 cubic yards;
{4`)         De")lition ofa strLicture or trail€i. by means of heavy equipment: and
{5}         The'   exca\y.ation.   placement,   or   grading   of  soil.   sand,   demolished   structtiral

components. or other material by. means of mechanized equipment.

(b}         A ciisturbance permit for the deposit of up to  12  inches offill on a site may be approved
\\'ithout a gcotcL`hnical  report; however. no distlirban€e permit for the placement of more
than  I 2  inches of fill  shall be isslied except for soil  to be deposited in engineered lifts in
acc`{trdaiice \vilh a ggotechnica]  report establishing compaction reqLiirements prepared by
a licensed engineer L`ertified  in  soil mechanics and in acci)rdance with a topography.'  plan

preparecl  b}'  a  licensed  civil  engineer  which  does  not  negatively.   impact  sun-ounding
propertic`s or the public drainage infrastructure.

(c)         At.ter a site inspection. a disturbance permit may be approved for L`learing and/or grubbing
of a site which does not negatively impact drainage on surrounding properties or the public
drainage infrastructure without a geotechnical report or a topography-plan.

(d)        No building permit shall be approved for a site following jssuance ofa disturba]ice permit
where the proposed structure or othei. improvement is inconsistent with the geotechnica}
repoi.t or topography plan.

(`e}        Incidental tree removal i/which does not affect the drainage on the-propert}'' shall not require
a distui.banL`e permit.

PART VIII. MISCELLANEOUS

Scc. 8:80. Bz`rbL]d wire and €]ectri€ fen€€s.

(a)         It shall be unlawful to build any barbed wire orclectriL` fence in an}H.ccQgnized subdivision
\\ithin the corporate limits of the city, or to permit such feiices to bL` or to remain on any
such property \`tithin such limits. However. such fences may be built aroiind undeveloped
areas \\'hen they ma}' be necessary. for the proper use or protection of the propert`.' and do

+

not create a hazal.d to the publiL`. Barbed t\'il.e erected n{}t less than six ft?i.t fibovLn the grouml
and   pi.ojectjng   e)i[irel}f.   \+\J~ithin   the   propelly   ma}r   be   permittecl   around   industrial   and
ccimmercial sites and around playgrounds. athletic fields ancl similar pr{ipti.ties \bliil-i. the`t`
ai+e nei`decl foi-the protection {if propel.tv or for reasons i)f safel`f .

(b)         I.-or the purpost`s of this section the term  "electric  f`ence"  is defined  a.s an}'  fence dL-signed
to earl.}' an i-]cctric current deri\'ecl  from an}t. source.

(c)         An}t  perstiiHriolating the provisions of this section shall  be  subj€L`Ho a  rlne i}fnot moi.e
than  $25  i!r  imprisonment  not exL`eecling ten  da`'s.  ol. both.  at  tile disLl-t`tion  i)f thc' court.
and  if n{-tt  r€mo`t-ed  €ifter  due  notice  b}r  the  direct{tr iJf thL.  Depal.tmem  {}f Public  \hJorks.

Page  12 of 37



such fence shfill be I.Lliioved bv the Department of Public Works at the owner's expense.~

See. 8:81. Mobile homes.

No relocation pet.mit shall be issuec] for the placing of an}r mobile home within Zone A on
the  flood  hazai.d  boundary  map  for  East  Baton  Rouge  Parish  until  the  biiilding  official  has
d€terminecl  thcit  the  mobile  home  is  or  shall  be  ane`hored  to  resist  flotation,  collapse  or lateral
movement in accoi-dance with the following requirements:
( I )   Over-the-top ties shaH be provided at each of the four corners of the mobile homes. with two

adcliticmal ties per side at intermediate locations \vith mobile homes less than 50 feet in length
requiring on]}r one adctitional tie per side.

(2}   Frame ties shall be provided at each comer of the home with fit;'e aclditional ties per side at
intermediate points with mobile homes less than 50 feet long requiring only  four additional
ties pet. side.

(3)   All components of the anchoring system shall be capable of carrying a force of 4,800 pounds.
(4)   All ac]ditions to an}-I mobile home shall be allchored as above.
{5)   Homes  constructed  aftei-June  15.1976.  under  the  Mobile  Home  Construction  Standards

established b}'  the U.S. Department of Housing and Urban Devel{]pment.  shall be anchored
according to .such standards set by the LT.S. Departmeiit of Housing and Urban Development;
otherwise all mobile homes shall compl}' with the requirements as set forth above.

See. 8:82. Satellite dishes.

Satellite dishes or other strui`tures designecl for the reception of video transmissions shall
not be locateci in any front yardt unless otherwise authorizecl b}-applicable zoning ordinances.

Siic. 8:83. Oil storage facilities.

(a)         No oil storage facilities shall be constriicted. operated or repaired without first obtaining a
special permit from the Department of Public W.forks.

(b)         No pei-mit shall bc issued forthis purpose without first obtaining the proper clearance from
the  fire department or disti.ict. the state  fire marshal's a+`fice. and  the state department of
environmental quality.

S€i`. 8:8J. S`vimming pools.

{a}  No person. fit.in or col.poriition in pi)ssession of land \\,ithin the city. upon \\J'hich is situated a
swimming poill i)r other outside bod}r of \\t'.ater designed for or used for s\ivimming. dipping or
immersion  purposes  by  men.  \\.onien {)r chilclren.  ot` a minimLim  ot` depth of 18  inches.  shall
fail  to maintain on the lot or pi-emises upon \\ilich sucll poc}l or bod}r of water is located and
completel}'. surrounding such bocl}' of \\-ater. a  fit.e-foot chainlink or \,\Tought iron fence with
no opening greater than  four inches  in a horizontal  clircction  or a  100 percent solid  fence or
wftll  constructi`ci not less thcln  fi\.e feet in  height:  pi.o\'ided. ho\\,.ti`\,'er. a clw.elliiig or accessory
bl]i]ding ma}r  bi.  us€cl £Ls pal-t of` such elll`1o.sure.

Pcigc  13  ol` 3 7



(b) All gates or doors opening through such closing and self-la{ching device designed to keep, and
capable  of keeping.  siich  door or  gate  seL`urely  closed  at  all  times  when  not  in  actual  use:

provided, ho\\t`re\;.ei.. that the dooi-of an}' dwelling occupied by human beings and forming any
part of the enclosure h€i.£inabove required need not be so equipped.

(c)  All  plans  hereaftei-submittec[  for swimming pools to  be constructed  shall  show compliaiice
with the I.equirLrments specified herein. and final inspection and approval of all pools hereafter
constructed shall be withheld until all requirements specified herein shall have been complied
with.

{d) Modification may be made in individual cases upon a showing of good cause with respect to
tfie  height,  nature  oi-  location  of the  fence.  wall  gates.  or  latches  or  the  necessit}7  therefor

provided the degree of protection is not redi'iced thereby.

(e)  Other protective deviL`es or structLires may be used so long as the degree of protection af±`orded
by the substitute devices or structures is not less than the protection afforded by the fence, gate
and latch clescribed herein.

See. 8:85. Fire hydrants.

(a)  Definition. For purposes of this section. the temi "fire official" shall mean the chief of the fire
department or his designee in which the propert}r is located.

(b)  Water supply.  Approved  fire h}rdrants sha]]  be provided  for bLlildings to meet the necessary
fire  flow  requirements  as  determined  b}''  the  fire  official.  Where  public  water  supply  is
inadequate  or  not  available.  an  approved  alternative  \vater  source  meeting  the  fire  flow
requirements sha]] he pro\i'ided.

{c}  Location.  The location and niimber {}f h}iJdrants shall be designated by the lire otTicial. but in
no case shall the clistance between installed fit.e hyclraiits exceed  1.000 feet. Maximum distance
from the nearest hydrant to the most remote exterior point of an}r buildiiig sha]]  be 500 feet.
The  distance  shall  be  measiired  i)n  a  roadway  surface  meeting  the  fire  department  access
requirements of section 602.6 of the Standa]`d Fire Preif'ention Code and all amendments and/or
modiflcations thereto.

(d}  plans  and   specifications.   plans.   specifications  and   }1}7-draulic   calculations  for  installation.
modification.  or alterations o1` aii\`'  fire servii`e main or rire hydrant Lshal]  be siibmitted to the
fire ol`ficial  for re`'iew and appn)i-ral prior to installation.

(e}  Preliminai?'' appi-o\,`tzil.  No building permit Shall  be  issued w'ithoLil preliminar}r appi.i)\'al  of the
fire official  imder this secti{tn.

(fy   Fire flow tests.  Fire-flow tests shall be witnessecl b}. the fire official prior to final approval.

(g)  Final  appro\i'al.  Bel`oi.i`  l~ina]  appro\'al  iind  aL`ceptance ot` I`li-g suppression.  altl].in.  detection  or
an}~  fire  protection  de`'ice  inclutling  stanclb.ty'.  piiwer  fai`ilities  and  fire  ventilating  systems.  in

Page  14 (,1`37



any building or structure. the installation shall be subjected to an acceptanc.e test. These tests
sha}]  be  adeqtiate  to  determine  that  the  system  or  fire  protection  device  has  been  properly
installed  and  will  function  as  intended.  It  shall  be  unlawful  [o  occup}t7  \\'ithin  portions  of a
structure  until  the  reqiiired  fire  pi-otection  systems  within  that  portion  of` thi-  striictur€  ha\L7'e
been testeci aml approved.

(h)  Pcrmjt  requi].ed.  No  person  shall  install,  make  alterations  or  aclditions  to  a  fit.e  p]-otective
signaling. detection or fire suppression s}'stem before securing a permit from the fii.e official.

(i)   Provisioncil  appro\'al.  The  fire  official  may  waive the pi.ovisions of the  section  and/or issiie
temporar}' or provisional approvals.

(j}   Exception. The provisions of this section do not apply to one-and t\\.a-±`amil}J dwellings or their
cletached accessoi.}' structui+es.

See. 8:86. Fire Sttppr€ssion Systems

All  contractors  doing  installation  work  on  fire  suppression  systems  shall  ha\'e  a  L`t]i.rent
certification from a fire .suppression company-. when applying for license. A current certificate must
be obtained €ind presented each year when obtaining license for the ensuiiig year. Work performed
or service of an  existing  firi`  suppression  s}J-steHl  other than the company.  which  has  issuccl  the
certific`ate. shall be covered by the contrac`tor's general liability.

See. 8:87. Signs.

No electrical]v illuminated sign shall be erected unless a permit has be€`n issiicd. the].efore.
The applications  for such  pgrnlit shall  contain complete specifications.  incliiding amperi. ratiiig.

pi.oposed location. iialiie of contractor making installation. manuf`actLirer's flame alid ownei.'s narme
together with such adclitional iii formation as may. be required to ensure coniplianc€ with this Code.
Where a sign is compl€te]y enclosed so that disassembl}7 for inspection is not possible. the building
of`ficial  may  accept  the  seal  of` a certil`ied testing laboratory  in  lieu {hereot-.  The biiilding o:t`ficia]
shall c€i.tit`y alid maintain a list of testing laboratories \\r.hich test. and rate ulei`tricfill}i. il]liminatec]
signs ac`cording to the requirements of this Code.

crlAPTER 2. ADMlr`TlsTRATloN oF BulLDING CODE

PART I. GENERAL PROVISIONS

See. 8:200. Contractor's License.

(a}  It shall  be the dut}J. of cver}f. colitractor who shall  make contrac`ts for the installation or I.epairs
of a  builcling  or  cirmponent  s}/'stem  co\jrered  b}`-  the  Code.  for  \f\;ilich  a  permit  is  requi}-ed.  to
compl}'  \\`ith  state  oi.  local  I.u}es  and  regulatio]is  concerning  lii`ensing  which  the  appliccib]e

g|}verliii|g auth{-]rit}ra  ma}f ha\Te adopted.

(b}  No permit shall  be issuecl except \`-here the conti-actor in chai.ge ol`thi` work h{is been licenst`d

Page  ]5 ol`37



as providecl above. and such permits shall be valid onl}' so long as a licensed eleL`trician shall
remain in charge of the work.

SeL`. 8:201. Established place of business required.

Every  L`ontractor  applying  t`or  a  p€rmi{  under  this  Titli±  8  InList  have  and  maintain  an
established place of business with facilities for rec€i\'.ing loc`al telephone calls foi. complaints, calls
and notices during normal business hours. from the di\,'isit)iis ol` the-Dep{irtment of Public Works
and persons for whom he has performed work.

PART 11.  PERMITS

Se[`. 8:210. Construction Doi`uments.

(1)  Building.  Applications  for  permits  shall  be  acc`ompaniecl  b~v  two  sets  of drawings  of the
proposed  work,  drawn  to  scale.  sho\fty+ing  foundation  plans.  fl{ior and  roof plans,  elevations,
sections and structural  details  sllfflcient  to  defille  completel}r'  th€` proposL`d  construction.  All

plans shall be accompanied by dLip]icate plot plans. elL`\'ations.  `s€ctions and structural details
sul`ficient to define completely the proposed constrLiction.  All  plfms shaH be accom.panied by
duplicate plot plans on legal or letter-size sheets shus\`.ing 1111  lot climensions and the location
of structure  upon  the  lot  or  property  with  r€ferenL`e  to  e€iL.h  lot  liiie.  For  all  buildings  or
structures except as otherw.ise pro`J'ided  by  this seL`tion. the application  for a builcling permit
shall  be  accompanied  by  a complete  set ot` plans  pri}par€d  by  an  ai.i`hitect  or civil  engineer
licensed in accordance \`vrith state law. or under his suptl.vision. and a L`ertific`ate signed by the
licensed architect or civil engineer that to the best of his kiiouy l€dg€ the plans and specifications
comply with and are in conformit}' \jvith the 1.eqiiirements of this Cticl£. the state fire code and
the state sanitary L`ode and that said plans and specifications \i-e].L' prepared b}J him or under his
supervision; and all applications sha]] also bL-accompanied b}t'' a loacl and stress sheet showing
the   weights   carried   by   the   suppolis.   inL`1uding   columns.   posts.   girders,   lintels.   pillars.
foundations and footings. when the building is full}.  loaded. and the safe loads such siipports,
etc„ will carry and stress sheet showing the str€sscs causeci b}i-thL` required wincl load and the
manner in which they are ti.ansmitted into the grolmd. The application for a permit for an}J. new
building or structure shall  be acc`ompanied  by'  a completL` description ol` the kind and size of
such buildings, the character of matt?rials to be used. the ground area to be L`overed. and the net
cubic contents of such  building.  Before a certifii`ale itf {)L`L`upanc`v  is  i.ssued. the i)wner must

~

furnish the building official a certificate from thc` €irchit€ct lil. i`i\'il engineL`I. certifying that the
building  or structure  has  been  completed.  to  the  best  of his  kni}wledge.  in  accordance with
plans  and  specifications  as  appi.o\;.ed  b}.  the  inspL3c{ion  di`'i`sion  and  the  maximum  li\'e  load
each  floor will  safely  L.arr}'.  The necessar}. plans.  and  cli.€i\` ings  for singlt`-family  residences.
duplex  apartments  and  bui]clings  aecessor}`  1o  d\,i.e]Iings.  £i!ti`i.{itions  oi.  I.Lapairs  that  do  not
involve  structural   changes.  oLitdoor  billboarcls  ancl   signs  not   ureighing  over  700  pounds.
inclucling supporting members. sheds. and small one-stol?' L`ommLi-Lial buildings not exceeding
18-l`oot  span and/or over  I.500  squai.L`  feet  ma}J-  bc  pi.ii)ared  b\'  thL`  owner oi. builder.  to  the

LI

effect that the plans and  speL`ifiL`ations eompl}.  \\ith  alld  artn  in i`onformjt}J.  \,`i-ith  requirements
of the code.  Where necessary  to  ensure  eomplianL`L`  \\ith  thin  L`i}dc.  the  biiilding  ol`ficia]  niav

r=

requii.e plans to be prepared b}' a licensed architect or ci`'il cngincLi.. The building official mat/'
il

Page-  16 of 37



require the application to be ciccompanied by a load and stress sheet for the items listed above
foi.  all  but  dwellings.   The  o\\iier  c}r  builder  shall   sign  a  certificate  to  accompany  such
application  for the  permit  to  thc cl`f`cct  that he  assumes  complete and  full  responsibility  for
compliance with all  fire. safet}' and health requirements.  Whenever necessary. plans shall  be
submitted  to the  state  fit.e  marshal. the  health  unit or the  state  board of healthT  for approval

prior to the issua!ice of the pcmiit.  F.ntraiices and exits shall be approved in accordance with
sound traf`fic safet}'' priticiples prior to the issuance of the permit.

(2) Mechanical.  Plans.  dra\\,.intts  and  specifications  must  be  prepared  and  stamped  by  a  state-
registered mechanical  engineer \\iio  shall  certify that the plans, drawings and specifications
comply with the requii.ements ilf this Code:

a.      For all commercial structures u-here the cooling load requirements is ten tons or more.
Exception:  Buildings \\ith  multiple tenan{s'  spaces that are separated  by  not less
than a one-hour fire rated assembly and \+.here the cooling unit do not exceed a total
of ten tons l`or an\' line-tenant space. the mechanical engineer stamp is not required.

b.      For additions to commi-rciti]  occupancies where the building official  determines the
complexit}J' of the adctitioiis \\-arrants the serv'ice of a registered mechanical engineer.
c.  The building official  ma}'. where hazards to life or property are involved, require
that a Louisialra-registered mechanical engineer prepare plans and specir]cations. even
though not other\\ise required b}~ this section.

{3)   P|+I.ng|}iii.g.. When required b}T the building of`ficial. two or more copies of specifications. and
of drawings  drawn  to  scale  with  sufricient  clarity  and  detail  to  indicate  the  nature  and
character  of the  work.  shall  acconipcin}.  the  application  for  a  permit.  Such  drawings  and
specifications shall contain infori"ition. in the form of notes or otherwise, as to tbe quality ot`
materials, u.here qualit}r is essentitil to conformity with the technical codes. Such information
shall  be  speeific.  €iml  thi`  technical  codes  shall  not  be  cited  as  a  substitute  for  specific
information. All infomiation. drfiuings. specifications and accompanying data shall bear the
iiame and signature orthc perso]i 1.esponsib]e for the design.

(4)   Electrical. Applications l`or permits shall be accompanied by plans and specifications showing
all  electrical  installatitiiis for \\.hich  the permit is sought. No permit shall  be issued until the
chief electrieal inspei`toi. hLis I.e\'ie\\.ed the plans and specirications. and any licensee shall do
no work \vithout first obtaining a permit therefor

S€c. 8:211. Action on permit fipplieiltions.

The  building  official  shall  act  iipon  an  application  for a  permit  w.ithout  unreasonable  or
unnecessary dela.v.  If the biiilcliiig iit`1icial  is satisfied that the work described in an app]icatioii for
a permit and the contract documciits filed there\\-ith conform to the requirements of the technical
codes  and  othei.  pertinent  la\\s  :ind  ordinances.  he  shall  issue  a  pemiit  to  the  applicant.  No
alterations shall b€ made  in the uirilig a+` an}+.  building for light. heat or pow-er. or increase in the
load caiTied b\r such wires. noi-shfill aii\T buildilig be \\ired for electrical  lights. motors. or healing~

devices without a \\.ritten pt.rmit.

PagL`  17  o1` 37



See. 8:212. End{'>rLsen€nt of Plans Upon Issuance of Permit.

When  the biiilding o1`ficial  issiies a permit, h€a shall €ndo].se.  in wi.iting or by  stamp.  both
sets of plans "Reviewed foi. Code Compliance." One set of drawings so re`J-it?wgcl shall be retained
by the builcling ol`ficial. card the ctther set shall be returned to thL' appliL`ant. The permitted drawings
shall  be  kept fit  the  site o~f`woi.k  and  shall  be opened  to  inspection by.-1h€  building ol-1-icial  or his
authorized repr€senLative.

See. 8:213. Rffus±i] to issue permit.

11` the application for a permit ancl the aL`companying contract doL`uments describing the
work  do  not  L`unform  to  the  requirements  of the  technicfll  codes  itr  other  pertinent  laws  or
ordinanc`es. the building official sha]] not issue a permit. but shall I.etum the conlri-let documents to
the applicant \\v'ith his refusal to issue such permit. SL]ch refusal shall. when requested, be in \\J'riting
a]ict shall c`oiitain the 1.eason  for refusal.

See. 8:21J. Permit fees; pa}i'ment

On all biiildings. component s};.stems, or alterations requiring a permit. a fee for each perinit
shall be paid as required at the time of filing application, in accordance with the schedule adopted
b}t. the Cit}... of St.  George. ancl no work shall  begin until the applicable fee{s) have been paid.  A

permit shall not be \J.alid until the fees prescribed by law have been paid, nor shall an amendment
to a permit be rL-li-ased i]ntil the aclditional fee. if any, has been paid.

SeL`. 8:215. Work commencing before permit issuance.

F€iilure of ally person within the meaning of this Title to take out a permit prior to provicling
an}r si`r\fii`cs gavel.ned hereby-or making any installation or repaii.s. shaH be subject to a penalty of
doublL.  the  amount  of the-fi.ted  fee  of the permit  {not  to  LJXL`eed  $1.000)  for the  type  of service
l`iiriiished.  I.epair [)r  insta]lLi[ion imade; and  this  shall  be  in  adclition  to any-a"]  all  other penalties

pro\,.'idecl  1`()r hi`rein.

Set`. 8:216. C{imlitions of permit.

A  permit  issued  shall  be  construed  to  be  a  ljecnsL.  to  proc`eed  \jvith  the  woi.k  and  not  as
authorit},'' to violate. cancel. alter. or set aside any of the provisions of the technical codes. nor shall
issuance of a pl'rmit pre`j.ent the building official from thereafter requiring a c{-trrection of erroi-s in

plans. L`ollstl.uctit)n. or violations of this Code. E`j.err permit isstlt?cl shall btni`onii' invalid tinl€ss the
w.ork authoi.iz.L-d  by  such  permit  is  commencecl  within  180 days  af`tei. it`i  issuanci`.  i)r  il` the \,York
aiithorizL`d  b}'  such permit is suspended oi. abandoned  for a pL-riod ol` 180 da}`'s after tlie time the
\,\t''ork is L`ommencecl. ()ne or more extensions of time. for periods not moi.e than tJ0 da.vs eaL`h. may
bi-  al]o\\+i*cl   foi.  the  permit.   The  extension  sha]]   be  I.L`qii€sti`d   in  w.I.iling  alic]  jusliriable  cause
d€m{)nsLralL.d.  Ext€[lsions shall  be gralltect  in uti.iting b}r the bui]cliiig (}}Ticia].

See. 8:2 I 7. Sign rt`quirL`d.

(a}  F.ach  pL`rsi)n  operating  under  a  pel.mit  gi-antecl   in  aec`orcianL`e  \\ith  this  L`hfipler  shall  ha\re

PagL-  18 of 37



displayed in a conspicuous place in front of each and evel.y place where work is being done by
them. a sign giving the name and address of the person doing the work in letters not less than
tw'o inches high.

(b)  Permanent signs containing the same infomiaticm shall be affixed to all vehii`les used on job
sites or used tcJ transport €quipme]it or materials to job sites.

(c)   The Department of public Works shall deli\i.er. by certified Unitecl States mail. a notice to any
contractor who violates this section. which notiL`e shall order compliani`e within ten days. The
building  official  shall  refuse  to  isstie  additional  permits to  any  person  who  fails  to  comply
within the time prescribeci. Permits shall be \\'ithheld for as long as the violation continues.

PART Ill. INSPECTIONS

See. 8:230. Building official and/or ins|]ector.

(a)  The  building  official  cind/or  inspector shall  be  responsible  for the  practical  application  and
eliforcement of this chapter.  He shall  make such  I.Sports to the board as  may  be required or
necessary to keep the board informed of the acti\`'ities of this section or as may be requested by
the board in order to properl}r administer the provisions hereof or to make recommendations
for revisions herein.

{b)  The   building  official   shall   employ.   such  assistants  as   ma}r.   be   necessar}J   to   inspect  all
constructions:  installations and equipment of whatever character and type for the inside and
outside of buildings, and shall have thL-po\ver to order removed` I.epaired or rebuilt any such
constructioii. installations and eqLiipment. \t\+hen in thei}.judgment. life or property, or both will
be bettei. protectecl thereby. and \\-ho shall enforce the sliict compliance of all laws governing
the use of electi.ical energy oi-constructii}n appl}ing within the cit}'.

See. 8:231. Fai]ur€ to comply; po``'er of inspector.

In any case o+` failure to compl}' \\.ith the pro\f'isi{tns of this Title. the inspector shall have
authority. after due-notice. to enforce cliscontinuancL-iintil the pi.ovisions are complied with.

See. 8:232. Right of entry.

Whenevel. necessal+I to make cln inspection to enforce an}J of the provisions of this Codet
or. \,\-hene\.`'er the building offli`ial  has I.easonablL` cause to belil`Te thcit there exists in any building
or  upon  any  premises  an}r  condition  or  i`ode  \,'ic}fation  which  makes  such  building.  structure.

premises.  electrical.  gas.  mechanic€il.  or  plumbing  s}'stems  unsafe.  dangerous  or hazai.dolls.  the
bLiilding  official  may  enter tlie  biiildilig.  structure.  i}r prLiilises  at  €111  reasonable times  to  inspect
the samc` or to pel.form ally dut}' imposecl upon the building oflii`ial  b}r this Code. If such building
or  pi.emises  are  oi`cupiecl.  hc  sliall  flrst  present  proper  credentials  and  request  €ntr}..   It` such
building or premises are unoec`iipied. he shall  first make a I.easonable effort to locate the owner {tr
other pel.sons having charge or control  of siich and request entr}'.  If entr}'  is refused. the building
official shall ha\'e recourse to €\'er\' rLiiied}. pro\.ided b}.  Ia\\j-to secui.e elitr}'.~

P.ig€  1 Q ol` 37



Se.`. 8:233. Inspection card.

The permit h{)Icler oi. his agent shall post the permit card on thejobsite in an accessible and
conspicuous  place.  The  permit  card  shall  be  maintained  b}7  the  permit  h{)ldei.  until  the  final
inspection h£Ls been macle and approved.

See. 8:234. Inspection services.

The building o`fficial may make. or causL± to be made. the inspections r€quirfd. I-Ie may accept
reports  of inspectors  of recognized  inspection  services  provided  that  after  investigation  he  is
satisfied as to their qiialifications ancl  I.eliability.  A eel.tificate i.alled foI. by any provision of the
technical codes shall  not be based on sLich reports unless the same are in uJtriting and certified b}'
a responsible ol`ficer of siich service.

(a)    Request for inspectit)n.  All  inspections reqilested prior to  8:30 a.in.  shall  be performed the
same business da}J. An}r inspection requested after 8:30 a.in.  shall bg performed on the next
business day: however.  in hardship cases and dire emel.gencies, the inspection di\'.ision will
make the inspection as soon as possible.

(b)   Inspections prior to issuance o±`certificate of occupancy or completion. The building ofricial
shall inspect or caiise to be inspected at various intervals all construL`tion or work for which a
permit  is  required.  and  a  final  inspi`ction  shall  be  made  of every  plumbing  system  upon
completion. prior to the issuance of the certificate of occilpanc}7 or completion.

{b)   Partial  inspections.  No  person  shall  cover  up  or  conceal  any  portion  of the  work  until
inspected.   In   ni-w   buildings  or  in  new  additions  to  older  hL]ildings:   immediately   upon
completion of those portions of the installation which are thereaftei. to be concealed ol. covered
up. the contrai`tor shall iiotif},`' the inspection division that such poilions of`the ins{allatioii ai.e
ready for inspei`ti{)n.  W'here the abo\''e djrecti+rc is not complied with, a stop-w'{)rk order ma}..
be issued ancl will remain in effect until \\I'ork has been uncoverecl and inspected.

(c)   Required  inspections.  The  biiilding  official  upon  notification  from  the pet.mit  holder or his
agent shall make the inspectii)ns reqLiired in order to comply with any of tht` tec`hnical codes
adopted  in  this  Title  and  such  otliei.  inspections  as  necessary.  and  shall  either  I.elease  that

poilion  of the  construction  or shall  notify  the  permit  holdei. ol.  llis  agent  of any  violations
which must be L`orrected in ordel. to comply with the techniL`al codes and this Title.

(d)    Fiiia]  inspections.  Immec]iatel}r  upon completion of` any  building of. component pall defined
in this Tit]c. the contractor shall notify-the inspection division that the building oi. installation
is coniplete and ready for final approval. No building shall be occupiecl or installation be put
into operation ii!itil the fiTial inspection has been made aiid approved.

(e)    Notification of inspectioii.  When signed and dated by the inspectt]r, thL. inspection card shall
constitute due notification of`an inspection.

{f)    Additi(}na]  repairs.  Whenever  an  alteration.  addition  or  rL+pair  is  made  to  any  building  or
componelit part defined in tliis Titl€'. othL-I-portions t)f the building tlr system shall be repairecl
or c(]rrccteci  to  L`t)nfonn  \\ith  the standards of the code.  except  that  no  rL.pciii. oi. carl.ection.
whic`h does not pi.esLlit a hazarcl to life or property. need be accomplished.

Pfige 20 01-3 7


